

Bid #19181

2019 Public Works Painting Project

Bid Opening Date: 11/19/2019

		RP Coating, Inc. Troy, IL	Era-Valdivia Chicago, IL	Tecorp, Inc. Joliet, IL	BP&T Co. Palatine, IL	G.P. Maintenance Palos Hills, IL	ATP Enterprise Northfield, IL	Continental Constr., Evanston, IL
Bid Item	Location	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost	Total Cost
1	Lakes of Long Grove Lift Station (Interior/Exterior)	\$ 9,200.00	\$ 105,000.00	No Bid	\$ 9,700.00	\$ 13,500.00	\$ 27,800.00	\$ 33,000.00
2	NCT Grit Washer (Exterior) & NCT Piping Grit Room	\$ 17,000.00	\$ 67,000.00	No Bid	\$ 22,800.00	\$ 15,600.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$ 66,000.00
	BID AMOUNT	\$ 26,200.00	\$ 172,000.00	\$ -	\$ 32,500.00	\$ 29,100.00	\$ 102,800.00	\$ 99,000.00
3	Greggs Reservoir	No Bid	\$49,000 or \$79,000	\$ 90,000.00	\$ 35,300.00	No Bid	\$ 122,000.00	\$ 116,300.00
	BID AMOUNT	\$ -	\$49,000 or \$79,000	\$ 90,000.00	\$ 35,300.00	\$ -	\$ 122,000.00	\$ 116,300.00
Unit Price	Unit Price per Lineal Foot for crack repairs beyond the scope of work	\$ -	\$49/sq. ft. or \$79/sq. ft.	\$ -	\$ 58.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -